Bid Tabulation

ITB 52-24 "Bottled Water, Cups and Cooler Rental”
Ericka Andrew, Principal Buyer

Email: andrewe@jccal.org

1
Water Way Distributing Company

2

DS Services of America dba Primo Water North America

3
Quench USA

Grand Total: $

104.74

$

53.47

$

441.25

Group I: 5-Gallon Water/Rental Coolers

I'\tltz)m Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. Pr'ggL_th Pricing Mfg. Pr,\cl)(c)il{ct Pricing

1  Distilled Water 5 gallons $ 6.75 Crystal Springs 13002021 $ 5.79 No Bid No Bid $ -

2 Natural Spring Water 5 gallons $ 6.75 Crystal Springs 13005021 $ 5.79 No Bid No Bid $ -

3 BOTTLE-LESS WATER COOLER Quench Q3 $ 38.00

4 Purified Water 5 gallons $ 6.75 Crystal Springs 13008021 $ 5.29 No Bid No Bid $ -
Monthly Cooler Rental (Standard Sized Multiple
Capable of Holding 5 gallons Water Items

5  Container) Top Load Cooler $ 5.00 PureFlo or Similar Numbers $ 3.99 No Bid No Bid $ -
Monthly Cooler Rental (Standard Sized Multiple
Capable of Holding 5 gallons Water Items

6  Container) Bottom Load Cooler $  10.00 PureFlo or Similar Numbers $ 3.99 No Bid No Bid $ -

7  Blue Springs Water; 5 gallons $ 1299 No Bid NoBid $ - No Bid No Bid $ -

Group | Total: $ 4824 $ 24.85 $ 38.00

Group |1: Bottled Water

I,\tlim Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. Pr,gg‘f“ Pricing Mfg. Pr'\(:gtfct Pricing
1  Bottled Spring Water, 10 oz. $ 5.25 No Bid NoBid $ - No Bid NoBid $ -
2 Bottled Spring Water, 16.9 oz. $ 5.25 Crystal Springs 130031721 $ 5.99 No Bid NoBid $ -
3 Bottled Spring Water 20 oz. $ 7.25 No Bid NoBid $ - No Bid NoBid $ -
4 Bottled Purified Water 10 oz. $ 5.25 Crystal Springs 13112410 $ 6.99 No Bid NoBid $ -
5  Bottled Purified Water 16.9. $ 5.25 Crystal Springs 13113174 $ 5.99 No Bid NoBid $ -
6  Bottled Purified Water 20 oz. $ 7.25 No Bid NoBid $ - No Bid NoBid $ -

Group Ill Total: $ 3550 $ 18.97 $ =

Group I11: Dispenser Cups

I,\tgn Description Mfg. Product No.: Pricing Mfg. Pr'il)gect Pricing Mfg. Pr'\(ng.t{ct Pricing
1 Paper Cone Cups, 5 0z. $ 5.25 Dart or Solo 20225003 $ 3.45
2 Plastic Cups, Flat Bottom 7 oz. $ 5.25 GR plas 20260036 $ 3.25 P02063 $ 261.82
3 Styrofoam, Cups 8 0z. $ 5.25 Dart or Solo 20250014 $ 1.15 Y300 $ 41.44
5  Styrofoam, Cups 16 oz. $ 5.25 Dart or Solo 20250012 $ 1.80 xDAR16J1¢ $ 99.99
Group IV Total: $ 21.00 $ 9.65 $ 403.25
Transportaton Charge $0.00 $0.00 $50.00

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __days after order

date. 2 Days 5 days 35 Days

Indicate the distance in miles from the County where

the service facility is located: 0 miles 10 miles 12 miles
! ! 510 35th St North Birmingham Al 2912 Commerce Square 100 Metro Parkway  Pelham,

Service location address: 35222 Irondale Al 35210 AL
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1 2 3
Water Way Distributing Company DS Services of America dba Primo Water North America Quench USA

Required Forms

Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES YES
Bid Form YES YES YES
Experience Statement YES YES YES
Subcontractors List YES YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES YES
Required Forms YES YES YES
PACA Forms YES YES YES

Contact Information

1 Water Way Distributing Co.

510 35th Street North Birmingham, AL 35222 | Contact: Reid Deshazo | Ph: 205-326-8800 ; 1-800-239-4032 Fax: 205-326-6640 |

Email: rdeshazo@the waterway.com

2 DS Services of America Inc. dba Primo Water North America

1150 Assembly Drive Ste. 800, Tampa, FL 33607| Contact:Davorin Todorovac | Ph: 678-486-3503 Fax: 678-460-3665 |

Email: sjackson@primowater.com

3 Quench USA, INC

630 Allendale Rd. Ste. 200, King of Prussia, PA 19406 | Contact: Cindy John | Ph: 888-554-2782| Fax: 610-930-9498

Email: salesops@quenchonline.com
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